ATTACHMENT VIII-J

ATTACHMENT VIII-J: Renewal of Current Milk Products, Bakery Products
and General Groceries

Suggested Motion: Move to approve the renewal of Schuring & Schuring, Alpha
Baking Co., and Performance Food Service - Fox River Foods
for one year

Recommended Action: Approve as presented.

It is recommended that the district renew its current agreements with the above vendors.

Our current agreement with Schuring & Schuring (milk products) includes an escalator pricing
method based upon butterfat pricing changes to receive the best market pricing. In March 2014,
Mrs. Boeke spoke with this vendor to pursue a renewal for 2014-2015. Pricing and nutrition
information was submitted to the district on April 24, 2014.

On March 17, 2014, Rhonda Boeke sent a letter to Performance-Fox River (general groceries)
requesting to pursue a renewal for 2014-2015. Pricing and nutrition information was submitted
to the district on April 24, 2014.

Mrs. Boeke also sent a request for renewal from Alpha Baking (bakery products) in March 2014.
Pricing was submitted by Alpha on April 29, 2014.



Schuring & Schurmg, Inc.

43W244 Plato Rd.
Elgin, IL 60124
Phone: 847-464-5458
Fax: 847-464-4535
“Family Owned Since 1934

North Boone Dist 200

ALTERNATE BID WITH ESCALATOR
2014-2015 SCHOOL YEAR

BID PROPOSAL

The undersigned supplier offers and agrees to fumish milk for your

school cafeteria in accordance with the following prices based upon the
CENTRAL MILK PRODUCERS COOPERATIVE official April 2014 price
announcement converted to half pints, based on the escalation clause below:

White 1% 1/2 Pints 0.2760

Chocolate Skim 1/2 Pints 0.2840

Skim 1/2 Pints 0.2650

Strawberry Skim 172 Pints 0.2900

Straws Case 30.0000
ESCALATION CLAUSE

This bid for 1/2 pints of milk is based upon the CENTRAL MIiLK PRODUCERS
COOPERATIVE for August 2014. This order has Class |, Skim at $22.62 per cwt.
and Class | 3.5% Butterfat at $29.67 per cwt.

The formuda to be used for milk price adjustments from month to
month will be $ .00025 for every $ .05 increment of increase or
decrease per cwi. in the cost of raw milk as announced by CMPC
Class I. Any adjustments in the price of butterfat can be
adjusted on all of the lowfat products used.

Submitted By:

SCHURING & SCHURING Inc.
Distributor of Muiler Pinehurst Products
a joint venture of Prarie Farms Inc.

=
v

M

Signature M” M
Duane Schuring /

President




From: Farin, Jon <jfarin@alphabaking.com>
Date: Tue, Apr 29, 2014 at 12:56 PM
Subject: Alpha Baking Pricing

Hi Rhonda,

My name is Jon Farin. | am the sales manager for Alpha Baking. | have left you a couple of voicemails so | figured |
would also send you an e-mail. | am handling the school bids for the next school year. We received a letter from you
dated 3/17/14 asking to renew for the 2014/2015 school year. We are glad that you would like to renew with Alpha Baking
however, | also want to let you know that we will be raising our prices on some of the items you currently buy from us for
the next school year. Below, | have included our current prices and what our new prices will be for the 2014/2015 school
year. The new pricing below will take effect on 7/1/2014.

Please let me know if you want to continue to buy from Alpha Baking after your next school board meeting.

We hope that you will decide to remain with Alpha Baking and we have enjoyed serving your school district over the past
couple of years.

If you have any questions, please let me know.

ltem # Description Current Price Proposed Price Increase
(School Price Table 315)

11162 1.5# White Wheat Split top bread $1.73 3$1.73
No price increase

11222 2# White Pullman $1.77 $1.84
.0023 per slice increase

12265 100% WW Bread 320z Pullman $1.73 $1.87
.005 per slice increase

33112 Soft Wheat Dinner Roll 12c¢t $1.52 $1.52
No price increase

51458 4” Hamb Wheat 30ct $3.24 $3.39
.005 per bun increase

53440 Wheat Hot Dog Buns 30ct $3.24 $3.78
.018 per bun increase

Thanks,

Jon Farin, Sales Manager
Alpha Baking

414-397-8624



Description Fox # Brand Manf # Fox Description Pack Size Price
BAKING SUPPLIES
Cake Mix, Chocolate 173300 Gilster 65001 6/5# Gilster Swiss Chocolate Cake Mix 6/5# $35.16 CS
Cake Mix, White 173305 Gilster 65005 6/5# Gilster White Cake Mix 6/54# $23.44 CS
Brownie Mix 173320 Hospitality 65801 6/6# Hospitality Brownie Mix 6/6# $30.63 CS
ills Vani Ici
Frosting, Vanilla Cream, Ready to Spread 175678 General Mills 11216 i{:lﬁ General Mills Vanilla Cream Icing 2/11# $55.32CS
2/11# } Mills Chocolate Fud
Frosting, Chocolate, Ready to Spread 175679 General Mills 11215 Ic/ing Ri:‘;enera llis Chocolate Fudge 2/11# $59.70 CS
Buttermist Pan Spray 169402 Butter Buds 56240 6/17z Butter Buds Mist Pan Spray 6/140z $21.77 CS
Vegelene Pan Spray 168324 Vegalene 22021 6/21 Oz Vegalene Pan Coating 6/21.50z $29.72 CS
Garlic Mist 169404 Butter Buds 56300 6/140z Butter Bud Garlic Pan Spray 6/140z 523.87CS
Sugar, Granulated 232106 Packer 220206  |50# Packer Label Granulated Sugar Bg 504 $22.28 CS Weekly
Sugar, Granulated 231991 Packer 225206 25# Packer Label Granulated Sugar Bg 25# $10.96 CS Weekly
Sugar, Brown 232548 Packer 525238 25# Packer Label Brown Sugar Light 25# $11.84 CS Weekly
Sugar, Brown 232420 Packer 568235  |12/2# Packer Label Brown Sugar 12/2# $13.58 CS Weekly
Sugar Packets (Regular) 232778 Fox 25509 3000ct Fox Sugar Packets 3000ct $15.93CS
2000/1gm West k Pink S
Sugar Packets (Sugar Substitute) 323617 West Creek 82056 Subgétft': est Creek Pink Sugar 2000/1gm |  $14.10CS
Sugar, Powdered 232327 Packer 325225 25# Packer Label Powdered Sugar 254 $11.46 CS Weekly
Sugar, Powdered 232211 Packer 355226  |12/2# Packer Label Powdered Sugar 12/24 $13.47 CS Weekly
Chocolate Chips {Regular Size) 170713 Ambrosia 4M ROYAL |25# Blommer 4m Chocolate Flavor Drops 1/25# $37.94 (S Weekly
Chocolate Chips {Mini Size) 170847 Barry Callebaut Usa 0936090438 |30# Callebaut Mini Chocolate Chips 254 $68.92 CS
Peanut Butter Chips No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.00
25# Special Ord Butt h
Butterscotch Chips 170715 ADM 334350 Chipspec'a rder Adm Butterscotc 1/254 $50.20 CS
. 25# M&M Milk Ch ini Baki
M & M type candies 670433 M&M 03131 B?ts Milk Chocolate Mini Baking 254 $79.72CS
Dry Milk 245971 Sturm 7089394065 |6/5# Sturm Nonfat Instant Dry Milk 6/5# $140.86 CS
Cocoa 170839 Packer 740333C3 |6/5# Cocoa 10-12% 6/5#4 $82.38 CS
Raisins 209682 Stapleton 721040 10# Stapleton Select Raisins 10# $20.42 CS
Vinegar, gal {(White) 254876 Woeber 00212 4/1gal Woeber White Vinegar 4/1gal $6.96 CS
. . 4 | Woeb L i
Vinegar, gal (Cider) 254874 Woeber 00214 | /183 Woeber Packer Label Cider 4/1gal $10.65 CS

Vinegar




Description Fox # Brand Manf # Fox Description Pack Size Price

MEATS $0.00

Foster Farm Corn Dog Nuggets, Turkey Meat 334799 Foster Farms 96096 239/.67z Foster Farm Corn Dog Turkey Cn 2/5# $20.65 CS

State Fair Turkey Corn Dog, 4 oz, #9481 334966 Foster Farms 96101 72/40z Foster Farm Corn Dog Turkey Cn 1/18#4 $24.90 CS

All Beef Hot Dog, 8/1 484936 Sugardale 0890 80/20z Sugardale Hot Dog Beef 6" 8/1 80/20z | $27.65 CS Weekly

State Fair Pancake/Sausage stick, 2.5 oz 56/2.85 Foster Farm Turkey Sausage

33498 Foster F 95121 56/2.85 19.50 CS

#70601 3 arms Pancake Whole Grain / oz ?
56/2.85 Foster F Turkey S e

Pancake Bites w/Sausage 334983 Foster Farms 95121 /285 Foster Farm Turkey Sausag 56/2.8502 $19.50 CS
Pancake Whole Grain

6/2.85 Pancake Wrap Blueb Maple

Blueberry Pancakes 334989 Foster Farms 96112  |20/%85 Pancake Wrap Blueberry Maple | (¢ ) oo, $23.34 CS
Whole Grain
12/1# ie-O Turkey Combinati

Jennie -O Combination Sliced Turkey, #2095 | 332004 Jennie-0 2095 ?/1# Jennie-O Turkey Combination 12/1# $33.08 CS
Sliced Pass Through Value

Jones Cooked Sausage Patty, 1 0z,#18755 332748 Jones 18715 160/1z Jones Dairy Pork Sausage Patty 160/1 oz $23.58 CS
160 i St Pork S Link

Jones Pork Link, Fully Cooked, 1 0z,#18510 | 332925 Betsy Ann 40702 COO@ZQU'"CV reet Pork Sausage Lin 160/10z $25.32 CS
4/7# ie-O Turkey & G ked

Jennie-O- Turkey Store 332118 Jennie-0 284728 | /7% Jennie-O Turkey & Gravy Cooke a/74 $68.89 CS
Pass Through Value

2.2z} ie-O Turk C

Jennie-O- Turkey Store 483160 Jennie-0 6134  |200/2:22Jennie-O Turkey Burger Cooked | 500 | §117 44 Cs
Pass Through Value

Pork Patties, Breaded, 3.0 oz cooked 387573 Pierre 3801 100/3.1 Pork Chop Patty Cn Pierre 100/3.10z $40.92 CS
104 A i ked Unb d

Beef Crumbles 331916 Advance 320600-0 dvancepierre Cooked Unbreade 104 $23.28 CS
Beef Crumbles

Beef, Pizzaburger (Frozen), 50/3.2 oz.

33233 S 020 2 M Pi P . .
Cooked Double patty w/ cheese inside 32330 upreme 50/3.20z Supreme Meats Pizza Patty Raw | 50/3.20z $27.30CS
. 160/1z Icelandic Fish Star N tC

Fish Nuggets ( Frozen), 1.5 oz 353969 iceland 20540 /12 Icelandic Fish Star Nugget Cn 160/10z $24.98 CS
Whole Grain

Fish Squares, Breaded (Frozen), 3.6 oz. 353968 Icelandic 20621 53/30z icelandic Seafit Sandwich Breaded| 53/30z $24.96 CS

Fish Sticks, Breaded (Frozen), 1 oz. 354202 Fishery 1089160 |00/107 Fishery Product Intl Oven Crunch| ooy o) $39.27 CS
Pollock Stix
6/1 f Ravioli

Chef Boyrdee School Pack 138630 Chef Boyardee g1a3g  |0/10 Chef Boyardee Beef Ravioli Tomato | ) g $30.34 CS

Sauce




Description Fox # Brand Manf # Fox Description Pack Size Price
9/2.70z A ierre Salisbury Steak
Salisbury Patty, 2.6 oz. 334345 Advance 16-627 (5:02 keé’z dvancepierre Salisbury Steak | - 55, 5, $24.50 CS
100/2.5 Ad ierre Pork Rib Patt
Rib Patty w/ BBQ sauce (frozen) 2.5 oz. 388960 Advance a4-531.0 |100/2:5Advancepierre Pork Rib Patty 100/2.502 $31.19 CS
Boneless Cn
24407 Hot Pocket Ham Ch
Pizza Pocket, Asst. flavors, 5 oz. 650455 Chef America 03200 /402 Hot Pocket Ham Cheese 24/402 $18.35CS
Individually Wrapped
60/5.452 Baja Beef & Bean Burrito Whol
Beef & Bean Burrito, 5.5 0z - 392529 Baja 13100 Grg ” Cs; aja Beet & Bean Burmito WHOIE | gn/54502 | $28.10Cs
T FF WG CHICKEN CHEESE BEAN
Beef, Bean & Cheese Burrito, 5.5 oz. Spec Order Foster Farm 5212 60 ¢ ¢ 60 ct $37.00CS
BURRITO CN
150/3.492 Tyson Chicken Patty Whol
Tyson Chicken Patty, 3.6 oz, #3731 477100 Tyson 70304 Grai/n C:Z yson Lhicken Fatty Whole 1 150/3.49 02|  $52.86 CS
750/.692 Tyson Chicken Chunks Whol
Tyson Chicken Nugget,575/.73 0z,#3732 477104 Tyson 70364 G‘? gi/n c;f yson Chicken Chunks Whole 1 513 456, | $52.43C5
1908/.2752 Tyson Chicken P
Tyson Popcorn Chicken, .26 oz, #2241 477118 Tyson 70368 |1°08/-2752 Tyson Chicken Popcorn 150/3.48Z $53.81 CS
Whole Grain Cn
450/1.132 Tyson Chicken Tender Whol
Tyson Chicken Tenders, 144 serv/cs, #3859 | 477102 Tyson 70334 Giai/n o z Tyson Lhicken tender Who'e 1 150/3.39.0z|  $50.79 CS
. . 150/3.49z Tyson Chicken Patty Hot &
Tyson Chicken Patty - Hot & Spicy, 3.23 0 477108 T 70314 , . 150/3.497 5431 CS
Y ¢ Y piey z yson Spicy Whole Grain Cn / 2
1200/.422 T hicken Sticks Whol
Tyson Chicken Fingers 477106 Tyson 70367 Grai?\/ an yson Chicken Sticks Whole -} 1 56/3 367 | ¢52.62C5
. ) 1908/.275z Tyson Chicken Popcorn Hot &
Tyson Chicken Nuggets - Hot & Spic 477116 Tys 70378 150/3.482 56.67 CS
Y g6 picy yson Spicy Whole Grain / >
Gilardi, Whole Grain Cheese Stuffed Sticks 192/1.93z Gilardi Cheese Stuffed Sticks
375066 Gilardi 7738712685 192/1. 43.82 CS
192/1.93 ¢s Hlardi Whole Grain /1.9302 243
Lil Bites, Pizza Rolls - All Flavors, Taco- 288/1z Lil Bites Ch &P i
, 375093 Little Bites 77022 /12 Lil Bites Cheese & Pepperoni 288/102 $40.44 CS
Pepperoni-Sausage Whole Grain
BREADS Whole Wheat/Whole Grain- $0.00
Rich when possible ]
. 72/12" T ican Original Whi
Tyson #7828, White Wrap 381403 Tyson 7828-621 Wr/ap yson Mexican Original White 72/12" $12.37 CS
Azteca #5101, 6" Flour Tortilla 209412 El Milagro 6ENFL-FS |42doz Elmilagro Flour Tortilla 6" 42doz $30.54 CS
Old El Paso or equal, small - Mission 209007 Mission 07381 200ct Mission Taco Shells Whole Grain 200ct $10.44 CS




Description Fox # Brand Manf # Fox Description Pack Size Price

Azteca # 9161, 10" Flour Shell 209394 Azteca 91610 24/6ct Azteca 10" Bakeabl Salad Shell 24/6ct $32.59 CS
Azteca # 85590, 8.5" Flour Shell 209395 Azteca 85590 24/6¢t Azteca 8.5"Bakeabl Salad Shell 24/6¢t $23.15CS
Pita Fold, 6" or 7" 383590 Kronos 2035 12/10ct Kronos 6" Perfect Pita 12/10ct $21.18 CS
Smucker's #6650 P.B & Grape Jelly 72/2.62 Smuckers Peanut Butter & Jelly
1 S k 6960 72/2.6 37.70CS
Uncrustable it i Grape Uncrustables Wheat /2602 >
ker's #6659 P.B & St I 72/2. kers P tB i
Smucker's rawberry Jelly 381503 smuckers 6961 2/2.6z Smuckers Peanut Butter & Jelly 72/2.6 02 $38.80 CS
Uncrustable Strawberry Uncrustables Wheat
Smucker's #6660 P.B. & Stra rry Jell 2/2. kers P Butter & Jell
3 2 BNy e 381503 Smuckers gog1 | /267 Smuckers PeanutButter&Jelly | o, 0, | ¢3880cs
Uncrustable Strawberry Uncrustables Wheat
mucker's #6655 P.B. & Gr Il 72/4.8z Smuckers P tB & Jell
e’ o pe 650476 Smuckers 6655 /4.82 Smuckers Peanut Butter & Jelly | ), o, $59.64 CS
Uncrustable Grape Uncrustables individual
Rich's # 87783, French Breadstick(Par-Baked)| 373980 New York 15022 125/1.50z New York Breadsticks 8" Baked| 132/1.50z $15.89 CS
Bridgeford # 6191, Buttermilk Biscuit, : 100/2z Bridgford Baked 3" Round
2 26.57
BakeOff 372561 Bridgford 6171 Buttermilk Biscuit 100/20z $26.57 CS
Bridgeford# 0264, Buttermilk Biscuit, Full X 1 . Bri Bak "Rnd B
ridgeford# 0264, Bu ilk Biscuit, Fully 372560 Bridgford 6185 90/2 250z Bridgford Baked 3"Rnd Bm 100/2.2507 $25.43 CS
Baked Biscuit
Rich's Plain Bagels Unsliced, Par Baked, . .
awin Lo S 650127 Muffin Town 99129  |72/4z Aesop Plain Bagel Sliced 72/402 $15.53 CS

#44751 - Sara Lee

New York Brand, Garlic Toast,#10021 372905 New York 10021 118ct New York Garlic Toast 118¢ct $18.60 CS

Michael's, Glazed Cinnamon Toast, 3.25 oz, 144/3.25z Michaels Cinnamon Glazed

399 i | # 75.65

#85805 28 Michaels 85818 French Toast Whole Grain A TR

PASTA $0.00

Wh

Macaroni Pasta Wheat 190208 Ital Pasta 2685 | L0F Nonna Whole Wheat Elbow 10# $15.69 CS
Macaroni

Spaghetti Pasta, 10" Wheat 190900 Betsy Ann 8813270 |2/10# Luigi Spaghetti 10" 2/10# $15.20 CS

Spaghetti Pasta, 10" Wheat 190122 Ital Pasta 2679 10# Nonna Whole Wheat Spaghetti 1/104# $15.13CS
208N ker L i P

Pasta Shells Wheat 190197 Nonna 9902248 Sheuson“a Packer Label Medium Pasta 20# $21.30 CS

Uncle Ben Whole Grain 135625 Producers BIPE25560 |25# Producers Long Grain Rice 254 $11.79 CS Weekly

Spanish Rice Mix, 2.25# bx 135985 Near East 05017 6/2.25# Near East Spanish Rice Mix 6/2.25# $21.11 CS

CHIPS $0.00

e 8 Y, Torti hi
Round Nacho Chip 128381 Azteca 20085 |B/2# Azteca Yellow Round Tortilla Chip 8/2# $18.89 CS

Whole Grain




Description Fox # Brand Manf # Fox Description Pack Size Price
BARREL O FUN SNACK 48/1z Barrel Of Fun Yellow Round Tortilla
ip, indi 40/1 9.29 CS
Round Nacho Chip, indiv wrap 281986 FOODS 21244 Chips Whole Grain /1 0z $
Frito-Lay Chips, Chips, Asst. Varieties, 104/cs 128693 Frito Lay 1102132397 }104/10z Frito Lay Fritos Chili Cheese 104/10z $29.70 CS
Frito Lay SunChips, Asst Varieties, 104/1 oz 128697 Frito Lay 11151 104/10z Frito Lay Sunchips Original 104/1o0z $27.62 CS
Low Fat/Reduced Fat Doritos 670897 Frito Lay 36096 72/10z Doritos Cool Ranch Reduced Fat 72/10z $18.94 CS
Baked Cheetos 128707 Cheetos Lays 21642 104/.880z Cheetos Baked Reduced Fat 104/.880z $28.05 CS
Rold Gold Tiny Twist Pretzel 670877 Rold Gold 19132 120/.50z Rold Gold Tiny Twist Prtzl 120/.50z $17.32CS
Sunchips 128697 Frito Lay 11151 104/10z Frito Lay Sunchips Original 104/10z $27.62 CS
Popcorn, White Cheddar Reduced Fat Spec Order Vitner Al179 50/.5z Vitners White Cheddar Popcorn 50/.50z $11.59 CS
COOKIES/CRACKERS $0.00
Cookie Dough, Sugar, 1 0z - Otis § 200513 Otis Spunkmeyer 58104 320/10z Otis Sugar Cookie Dough 320/1o0z $§27.94 CS
Cookie D h, Ch late Chunk, 3 . 107/3 is Chocol hip Cooki
ooite Lough, Lhocolate thunk, 5 02 200516 Otis Spunkmeyer 59300 /30z Otis Chocolate Chip Cookie 107/30z $31.01CS
(Chippery) Dough
Cookie D h, Double Fudge G , 1. 40/1. Mrs Rich Fudge B i
ookie Doug ouble Fudge Gourmet, 1.5 371752 Mrs Richs 39669 2 0/‘ 50z Mrs Rich Fudge Brownie 240/1.507 $57.88 CS
0z Cookie Dough
240/10z Richs Chocolate Chip Cooki
Cookie Dough, Choc. Chip, traditional, 1oz | 371801 Richs 04810 | 81 OOZ ichs Lhocotate Lhip Lookie 240/102 $33.95 CS
240/1.50z Mrs Rich Macadamia Cooki
Cookie Dough, Macademia, 1.5 oz 371705 Mrs Richs 39714 Dou/g - oz Mrs Rich Macadamia LOOKIE 1 5 40/1.502 $62.80 CS
108/30z Redi Bake White Chocolat
Cookie Dough, Macademia, 3 oz 372111 Redi Bake 04298 /302 Redi Bake White Chocolate 108/302 $67.82 CS
Macadamia Cookie Dough
108/30z Redi Bak M&M
Cookie Dough, M&M, 3 oz 372110 Redi Bake 04299 /302 Redi Bake Supreme M& 108/30z $67.82 CS
Cookie Dough
200/1. Best Maid Chocol hi
Cookie Dough, M&M, 1.5 0z 372142 Best Maid spgao  |200/1.507 Best Maid Chocolate Chip 200/1.502 $41.58 CS
M&M Cookie Dough
Cookie Dough, Oatmeal Raisin, 3 . 106/30z Otis S t Di Oat |
e bous 200552 Otis spunkmeyer 59953 6/302 Otis Sweet Discovery Oatmea 106/30z $56.82 CS
oz{Chippery} Raisin
. ) v P i F |
Pepperidge Farms Pretzel Goldfish 155571 Pepperidge Farms 14396  |200/:7507 Pepperidge Farms Pretze 300/.7502 $41.62 CS

Goldfish




Description Fox # Brand Manf # Fox Description Pack Size Price
300/.750z P i F Chedd
Pepperidge Farms Cheddar Goldfish 155573 Pepperidge Farms 14367 Goléfishaz epperidge Farms Cheddar 300/.750z $45.50 CS
00/2ct Heri O ker Salti
Saltines, 2 pk wrap 271119 Heritage Ovens 13654 |°00/2¢t Heritage Ovens Cracker Saltine | o, o $14.07 CS
Individually Wrapped
Saltines, 4 pk wrap 186340 Keebler 01446 300/4ct Keebler Saltine Cracker 300/4ct $17.27 CS
14 Best Mai late Chi
Choc. Chip Cookie, IW 372150 Best maid w818 4/10z Best Maid Chocolate Chip 144/102 $30.72 CS
Cookie Individually Wrapped
Peanut Butter Cookie; IW 180775 Grandmas 45091 60/2ct Grandmas Peanut Butter Cookie 60/2ct $18.33 CS
240/1o0z Rich | Raisin Cooki
Oatmeal Raisin Cookie, IW 371565 Richs 04802 Dot/g h°z ichs Oatmeal Raisin Cookie 240/102 $36.00 CS
216/.750z Darlington § ki
Sugar Cookie, IW 180530 Darlington 23410 6/.750z Darlington Sugar Cookie 216/.7502 $30.65 CS
Individually Wrapped
Graham Cracker, 3 ¢t IW 180295 Nabisco 01350 150/3ct Nabisco Graham Crackers 150/3ct $16.30 CS
Azar Carnival Crunch Snack Mix IW 128808 Azar 7213215 {150/.750z Mix Carnival Crunch Azar 150/.750z $29.58 CS
Animal Crackers, W {meets CN bread req) 216247 Austin 48786 100/10z Austin Zoo Animals Crackers 100/10z $15.73 CS
Pepperidge Farms Goldfish Graham, 2 ¢t IW, ) 300/2ct Pepperidge Farms Goldfish
4 .34 CS
#15094 155569 Pepperidge Farms 1509 Cinnamon Graham Whole Grain 300/2ct $38.3
1.5 kers Cheez | k
Sunshine, Cheeze-It Crackers, 1.5 oz 186578 Cheez-lIts 12261 gg{\ Shizz Crackers Cheez [t Snac 60/1.502 $19.27 CS
Nabisco, Oreo Cookie, 100 cal, #00938 188001 Nabisco 00938 72/.80z 100 Calorie Oreo Cookie Nabisco 72/.802 $21.89 CS
Nabisco, Chips Ahoy, 100 cal #937 188000 Nabisco 937 72/.80z Nabisco 100 Calorie Chips Ahoy 72/.80z $21.89 CS
BREAKFAST $0.00
80/2.75 Super Bakery Honey Bun Whole
Super Bakery Honey Bun 385136 S Bak 6060 80/2.75 26.17 CS
P v Y uper Bakery Wheat Individually Wrapped / oz >
Super Bakery Super Donut 369186 Richs 13530 84/2.10z Richs Ring Donut Homestyl 84/2.10z $24.66 CS
. k
Super Bakery Chocolate Donut 385137 Super Bakery 6009 80/,2 ,22 Super Bakery Chocolate Donut 80/2.2z2 $26.18 CS
Individually Wrapped
Super Bakery Super Bun 369207 Richs 49803 60/2.250z Richs Long John Donut 60/2.250z $21.17 CS
Super Bakery Donut Plus 372989 Richs 06330 84/20z Richs Premium Old Fashion Donut| 84/20z $25.28 CS
Super Bakery MVP Breakfast Donut 369203 Richs 04984 96/30z Richs Jelly Filled Donut 96/30z $35.48 CS




Description Fox # Brand Manf # Fox Description Pack Size Price
300/.860z Michaels F h Toast Stick
Michaels French Toast Sticks, 1.86 oz 399517 Michaels 85803 /-860z Michaels French Toast Sticks | 55/ g6, $30.75 CS
Pass Through Value
144/3.25z Michaels Ci Glazed
Michaels French Toast Whole Grain 3.250z | 399528 Michaels 85818 /3.252 Michaels Cinnamon Glaze 6/5t $75.65 CS
French Toast Whole Grain
144/1.1zV Belgian Waffle Whol
Waffle Sticks 373004 Chef America 00251 /1.1z Vans Belgian Waffle Whole 144/1.10z |  $18.50CS
Grain Sticks
Pancakes, 1.25 oz 373100 Echo MF 7002 |36/4ct Echo Pancakes 144/1.2502 $11.22CS
Kellogg's Poptart, IW, 1 ct. Whole Grain Rich 216189 Kelloggs 19721 72/2ct Kelloggs Poptart Chocolate Chip 72/2ct $35.47 CS
. 216/1.2z Darlington Appleway Apple
Darl F Appl 1 97 Appl 701 216/1.2 41.01CS
arlington Farms, Apple Granola Bar, IW 805 ppleways Bars 0100 Oatmeal Whole Grain 6/1.20z S
Darlington F , Fruit Strudel, ) . . . . .
N‘;“/r ington Farms, Fruit Strudel, Strawberry, | gy No Bid NoBid |No Bid No Bid $0.00
. . . 160/1.50z Darlington Breakfast Square
Darlington Farms, Fruit Strudel, Apple, IW 180587 Darl 24200 . 160/1.5 0z 37.11CS
e i ! ppie arlington iced Individually Wrapped Whol / >
Darlington Farms, Breakfast Bar, Cinnamon, . 160/1.50z Darlington Breakfast Square
180587 Darl 24200 160/1.5 37.11CS
w arlington iced Individually Wrapped Whol /1.5 02 >
X 24/4 is wild Bl Muffi
Muffins, Assorted Flavors, IW 200478 Otis Spunkmeyer 00100 /42 Otis Wild Blueberry Muffin 24/402 $16.50 CS
Individually Wrapped
1 Mills A i
Malt-O-Meal Assorted Cereals 371704 General Mills 31879 iﬁ/e ;ssenera' ills Apple Cinnamon 96/1 oz $22.60 CS
DRESSINGS $0.00
Salad Dressing, gal 241130 Jason 77121 4/1gal Jason Salad Dressing 4/1gal $19.13CS
Mayo, 12 GM Portion Pack 240688 PPI/Heinz 78000845 200/12gm Ppi American Mayonnaise 200/12gm §7.31CS
Mayo, gal 240659 Ventura 10741VEN [4/1gal Ventura Mayonnaise 4/1gal $21.84 CS
Miracle Whip, gal 241555 Kraft 63316 4/1gal Kraft Miracle Whip 4/1gal $40.57 CS
. 2 vill Th
Dressing, 1000 Island, gal 364665 o6g24 |*/182! Village Gardens Thousand Island |, | $25.94 CS
Dressing
, 4 IB i
Dressing, Red French, gal 131831 Betsy Ann 10897  |*/182! Betsy Ann Wild Western French 4/1gal $30.97 CS
Dressing
. 4 ild W
Dressing, Red Ranch, gal 131831 Betsy Ann 10897  |*/182! Betsy Ann Wild Western French 4/1gal $30.97 CS

Dressing




Description Fox # Brand ~ Manf# Fox Description Pack Size Price
4/1gal Bonne Chere Oldfashion Ranch
Dressing, Ranch, gal 131823 Boncher 1013  |*/182! Bonne Chere Oldfashion Ranc 4/1gal $30.51 CS
Dressing
4/1gal West Creek Reduce Calorie Itali
italian, Reduced Calorie, gal 201339 West Creek 05633 D/r ijin\ges reek Reduce Calorie ftallan | /1 cal $23.06 CS
DRINKS $0.00
Gatorade - Assorted Flavors 101022 Gatorade 20406 24/200z Gatorade G2 Low Calorie Grape 24/200z $18.82 CS
96/40z A 100% Apple Juice C
100% Apple Juice, 4 oz. Cups Not Frozen 395094 Ardmore 40001 Fre/sl: z Ardmore ° Apple Juice LUp 96/40z $10.99 CS
96/40z Ardmore 100% Apple Jui
100% Apple Juice, 4 oz. Cups Not Frozen 395094 Ardmore 40001 Fre/s: z Ardmore % Apple Juice Cup 96/40z $10.99 CS
48/67 Citrus Systems Fresh Apple Juic
100% Apple luice, 6 oz. Cups Not Frozen 395010 Citrus System 610110 | 0(/); Itrus Systems Fresh Apple Juice 48/6 0z $7.94CS
0
96/4z Citrus Systems Fresh Jui
100% Orange Juice, 4 oz. Cups Not Frozen 395001 Citrus System 610101 1039: itrus Systems Fresh Orange Juice | g0 /4 o, $12.86 CS
96/4z Cit tems Fresh Orange Jui
100% Orange Juice, 4 oz. Cups Not Frozen 395001 Citrus System 610101 10(/); itrus Systems Fresh Orange Juice | g¢/4 6, $12.86 CS
0
48/62 Citrus Systems Fresh Orange Jui
100% Qrange Juice, 6 oz. Cups Not Frozen 395009 Citrus System 610103 10‘/3; ttrus systems Fresh Lrange Juice 48/6 oz $9.73 CS
{"]
100% Fruit Punch Juice, 4 oz. Cups Not 96/4z Citrus S Fresh Fruit Punch
ruit Punch Juice ups No 395006 Citrus System 610124 6./ z Citrus Systems Fresh Fruit Punc 96/4 oz $13.01 CS
Frozen Juice 100%
100% Fruit Punch Juice, 4 oz. Cups N 96/42 Ci h Fruit P
ruit Pu uice, 4 oz. Cups Not 395006 Citrus System 610124 ./ z Citrus Systems Fresh Fruit Punch 96/4 oz $13.01 CS
Frozen Juice 100%
100% Fruit Punch Juice, 6 oz. Cups Not
T b g i 395081 Ardmore 41413  |48/60z Ardmore 100% Fruit Punch Cup 48/602 $9.37 CS
100% Pineaple/Orange Juice, 4 oz. Cups Not 96/4z Citrus Syst Fresh Pi |
P PSTOY 1 395007 Citrus System 610136 OIS REDIRCEIAE 96/4 oz $12.43 CS
Frozen Orange 100% Juice
100% Pineaple/Orange Juice, 6 oz. Cups Not - 96/4z Citrus Syst Fresh Pi |
e i 395007 Citrus System 610136 e et LSRR 96/4 oz $12.43 CS
Frozen Orange 100% Juice
o 9 ‘ .
100% Apple Juice, 4 oz. Cups Frozen 395094 Ardmore 40001 Ffe/ :: z Ardmore 100% Apple Juice Cup 96/40z $10.99 CS
- .
100% Apple Juice, 4 oz. Cups Frozen 395094 Ardmore 40001 21/ :: z Ardmore 100% Apple Juice Cup 96/402 $10.99 CS
_ 7 : .
100% Apple Juice, 6 oz. Cups Frozen 395010 Citrus System 610110 |+2/62 Citrus Systems Fresh Apple Juice 48/6 oz $7.94CS

100%




Description Fox # Brand Manf # Fox Description Pack Size Price
. ) 48/6z Citrus Systems Fresh Apple Juice
100% Apple luice, 6 oz. Cups Frozen 395010 Citrus System 610110 100% 48/6 oz §7.94 CS
0
96/4z Citrus Syst Fresh O i
100% Orange luice, 4 oz. Cups Frozen 395001 Citrus System 610101 10{); ftrus Systems Fresh Orange Juice 96/4 oz $12.86 CS
(4]
96/4z Citrus Syst Fresh O Jui
100% Orange Juice, 4 0z. Cups Frozen 395001 Citrus System 610101 | O{WZ 1trus Systems Fresh Lrange e | 96/4 0z $12.86 CS
[
50/60z Hormel Healthlabs Nutritional
100% Orange Juice, 6 oz. Cups Frozen 393322 Hormel 16784 /602 . . @ utritiona 50/60z $66.66 CS
Orange Juice Drink
48/6z Citrus Systems Fresh Orange Jui
100% Orange Juice, 6-0z. Cups Frozen 395009 Citrus System 610103 1 O{W s 5y esh Lrang « 48/6 oz $9.73 CS
(]
96/4z Citrus Systems F 0 e Fruit
100% Fruit Punch Juice, 4 oz. Cups Frozen 413454 Citrus System 610032 Pu{] cf] j;:':: ystems Frozen Drange Fiilt | 96/4 oz $12.86 CS
96/40z Ard 100% Fruit Punch C
100% Fruit Punch Juice, 4 oz. Cups Frozen 395091 Ardmore a0015 | e{ S: z Ardmore 100% Fruit Punch Cup 96/40z $11.90 CS
100% Fruit Punch Juice, 6 oz. Cups Frozen No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.00
100% Fruit Punch Juice, 6 oz. Cups Frozen 395081 Ardmore 41413 48/60z Ardmore 100% Fruit Punch Cup 48/60z $9.37 CS
100% Pi | Juice, 4 oz. 6/4z Ci h Pi |
% Pineaple/Orange Juice, 4 oz. Cups 395007 Citrus System 610136 96/4z Citrus Sys'Fems Fresh Pineapple 96/4 oz $12.43 CS
Frozen Orange 100% lJuice
100% Pi le/O Juice, 6 0z. C .
¢ Pineaple/Orange Juice, 6 oz. Cups No Bid No Bid NoBid  |No Bid No Bid $0.00
Frozen
V8 Splash, Asst. Flavors, 11.5 oz, 103766 V8 5100014655 {12/160z V8 Splash Strawberry Kiwi 12/160z $11.95CS
V8 Vegtable Juice 103748 Campbells 5100000067 148/5.50z Campbells Lo Sodium V8 Juice 48/5.50z $22.11CS
Welch's Drink, Asst. Flavors, 11.5 oz 100987 Weichs 30800 24/11.50z Welchs Grape Drink 24/11.50z $12.86 CS
24/16.9z P 1Z G Fi
Fruit 2-0, Asst Flavors, 20 oz bottle 100983 Propel 00173 w: o 2 Propel zero Grape Fitness 24/16.902 $13.99 CS
. 24/16.9z P 1Z Fit
Propel, Fitness Water 100983 Propel 00173 W:ftesr 9z Propel Zero Grape Fitness 24/16.90z $13.99 CS
RW!I Sparkling Water, Asst Flavors, 16.9 oz 395299 Health Fusion 86 24/16.90z Riptide Wave Gonzo Grape 24/16.90z $14.30 CS
Spring Water, 16.9 oz. 105839 Absopure 603711  |24/16.9z Absopure Spring Water 24/16.90z $3.49 CS
Sunny Delight Citrus, 6.75 oz 100891 Sunny Delight 01308 24/6.750z Sunny Delight Citrus Punch 24/6.750z $6.97 CS




Description Fox # Brand Manf # Fox Description Pack Size Price

24/8z Fruit 66 Sparkling Kiwi St b

Fruit66 (4U2U Brands) 100969 Fruit 66 CKS24001 Mi ez FUit 66 Spariding BIWi SITBWBETY 1 54/802 $15.99 CS

FRUITS / DESSERT NOVELTIES Al

Fruit 6/#10 and or 4 oz cups packed in $0.00

juice

Diced Peaches Cups (frozen), 4 oz 113985 Dole 03073 36/40z Dole Diced Peaches Juice 36/40z $18.03 CS
6/10 Com Packer Label Peach

Diced Peaches (Canned) 111658 Comsource 723 /10 Comsource Packer eac 6/4#10 $33.77 CS
Diced Light Syrup
6/10 C Packer Label Peach

Diced Applesauce Cups (frozen), 4 oz 111658 Comsource C723 / c.)msource el reac 6/#10 $33.77CS
Diced Light Syrup

Applesauce (Canned) 228600 West Creek FFASR8100W |6/10# West Creek Applesauce Sweetened 6/#10 $23.94 CS

Diced Mixed Frozen Fruit Cups (frozen), 4 oz 113986 Dole 03065 36/40z Dole Mixed Fruit Juice 36/40z $18.02 CS
6/10 Packer Label Fruit Mix |

Diced Mixed Fruit (Canned) - Comsource 110830 Comsourse 58277 |, : e Comsource Packer Label Fruit Mixin| 01 $38.55 CS
4/5# Simplot Individuall ick F

Mixed Fruit (frozen) - 1# bags 100792 Simplot 17711 |¥/5# Simplotindividually Quick Frozen 4/54 $32.53 CS
Mixed Fruit
6/10 Packer Label Whole Mandari

Mandarin Oranges (Canned) - In own Juice | 111100 Pacific Delight 73600  |O/10 Packer Label Whole Mandarin 6/410 $24.25 CS
Orange In Juice

Diced Pineapple Chunks (frozen), 4 oz 113987 Dole 00419 36/40z Dole Pineapple Tidbit In Juice 36/40z $18.93 CS
6/10 Packer Label Pi le Tidbit |

Pineapple Tidbits (Canned) 113301 Packer 30050 | : . acker Label Fineappie TIabitin 6/410 $30.80 CS

Diced Pear Cups (frozen}, 4 oz 221458 Advance 802401 96/4.75z Advancepierre Pear Fruit Cups | 96/4.75 oz $54.50 CS
6/10C Packer Label Diced P

Diced Pears (Canned) 112305 Comsource 5254956224 |&/10 Comsource Packer Label Diced Pear | o, $32.74.CS
Light Syrup

Minute Maid Frozen Juice Bar, Asst. Fl ,

o rozen 1t VO | spec Order 1&J 7332103822 |100/2.250Z SP GRAPE JCE BAR J&J 100/2.250z|  $21.90 CS

lello Cups, Asst. Flavors, 4 oz. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.00
12/4pk H k Pack illa Puddi

Pudding Cups, Asst. Flavors, 4 oz. 138621 Hunts 55402 Fat/ Ffee unts Snack Pack Vanilla Pudding |, 4oy $15.07 CS

Pudding (Canned), Asst. Flavors 206474 Unipro 7987356 U 16/10 Unipro Embassy Vanilla Pudding 6/#10 $23.01CS

ICE CREAM NOVELTIES $0.00

Snickers Big Bar, 2.66 oz, #40051 Spec Order Good Humor 6016 48/3.33z Snicker Ice Cream Big Bar 48/3.330z $39.39CS




Description Fox # Brand Manf # Fox Description Pack Size Price
Choco Taco, 4.24 oz 201220 Good Humor 2015 24/40z Good Humor Choco Taco 24/40z $24.30 CS
24/4. H i Cooki
ice Cream Big Sandwich, 3 oz 201133 Good Humor 1804 Saﬁz?;GOOd umor Premium Cookie 24/4.50z $20.40 CS
Shake Assorted Flavors,low fat, 12 oz 201176 Schoeps 134200 |24/6z Schoeps Malt Cup Lowfat 24/6 oz $16.42 CS
Klondike Cone, 4.6 0z No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.00
Kiondike lce Cream Bar, 5 oz 201127 Good Humor 2023 24/5.5z Klondike Original Vanilla Bar 24/5.50z $20.40 CS
Sundae Cone, 4 02 201224 Schoeps 1622 24/4z Schoeps Vanilla Nut Sundae Cone 24/40z $12.11CS
M&M Cookie Bar, 4.25 oz | NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.00
Popsicle Pop Shots; 3.2 oz 201167 Good Humor 2244 12ct 3.2 Oz Good Humor Popsicle Shots 12¢t $9.10CS
Popsicle Turbo Treat, 3 oz - 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.00
's #61571, Jol e
f:f;wan s #61571, Jolly Green Apple Frozen |\ 54 No Bid NoBid  |No Bid No Bid $0.00
Schwan's #61572, Joly W |
C‘;pwa s #61572, Jolly Watermelon Frozen |\ g No Bid NoBid  |No Bid No Bid $0.00
Schwan's #61553, Caramel lce Cream Bar NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.00
PIZZAS / Whole Grain $0.00
Gilardi Cheese Quesedillas #12531 375074 Gilardi 7738712531 |48ct Gilardi Cheese Quesadilla Cn 48ct $30.47 CS
Gilardi Chicken Quesedillas; 375069 Gilardi 7738712532 {48ct Gilardi Chicken Quesadilla Cn 48ct $31.47 CS
ilardi Fi ids Pl |
Gilardi, 4X6 Cheese, 96 ct,#12075 375147 Gilardi 7738712718 |22/ 4X6 Gilardi Fit For Kids Plus Whole 96ct $39.95 CS
Grain Cheese Pizza
. 4x6 Gilardi kP iPi Fi
Gilardi, 4X6 Turkey Pepperoni, 96 ct,#12076 | 375165 Gilardi 7738712656 |20/ #*6 Gilardi Turk Pepperoni Pizza Fit 96ct $35.93 CS
For Kids Whole Grain
. . 72ct Gilardi Ch t 100%
Gilardi, Twisted Stuffed Crust 72/5.90z 352878 Gilardi 7738712616 |/ 2t Gllardi Cheese Stuffed Crust 100% |, ¢ oo, $43.48 CS
Whole Grain
. 4 ilardi Turk Pi i
Gilardi, 4X6 Sausage, 96 ct,#12405 373576 Gilardi 7738712703 |20/ #*6 Gilardi Turkey Sausage Pizza it 96ct $35.98 CS
For Kids Whole Grain
740z Gil i Pi
Gilardi, Double Stuff Pizza 96/3.74 oz 375121 Gilardi 7738712683 |2°/37407 Gilardi Cheese Pizza Whole | o0/ o) ) $40.83 CS
Grain Double Stuffd Cn
4.84 i i i
Gilardi , Stuffed Crust 72/5.750z 375117 Gilardi 7738712671 |12/ 48402 Gilardi Cheese Pizza Whole 72/5.7501 $36.98 CS
Grain Stuffed Crust Cn
Gilardi, Southwest 96/50z 375125 Gilardi 7738712623 |°0/3742 Gilardi Southwest Pizza Whole | o /c ) $45.23 CS

Grain Real Slice




Description Fox # Brand Manf # Fox Description Pack Size Price
96/4x6 Tony Smart Whole Grain Chees
Tony's SMART Cheese, 4X6, #78454 397559 Tonys 78673 Piz/z . Y 96/4x6 $46.91 CS
96/4x6 Tony Smart Whole Grain
Tony's SMART Pepperoni, 4X6, #78455 397560 Tonys 78674 /4x6 Tony ' 96/4x6 $36.00 CS
Pepperoni Pizza Cn
96/4x6 Tony Smart Turkey Sausage
Tony's SMART Sausage, 4X6 388892 Tonys 72557 / W Y & 96/4x6 $35.67 CS
Whole Grain
80/4.61 Tony Smart Classic Wedge
Tony's SMART wedge, 4.79 oz,#74712 397562 Tonys 74709 Ch/e o Y 8 80/4.807 $45.22 CS
Tony's French Brd Pizza, 4 4.18
ony's French Brd Pizza, 4 cheese, No Bid No Bid NoBid  |No Bid No Bid $0.00
oz, #78514
96/5.44z Tony Fiestada Pizza Whole
Tony's Fiestada,5.22 oz, #78534 373603 Tony's 68516 Grg o ztony™H 2 96/5.44 0z |  $56.17 CS
96/5.44z T Fiestada Pi Whole
Coyote Grill Fiestada,5.22 oz, #78535 373603 Tony's 68516 Grg o z fony Flestada Fizza 96/5.44 0z $56.17 CS
POTATOES $0.00
6/4.5 Simplot Fry Shoestring Nat Cri
Simplot Natural Crisp Shoestring, #47512 365324 Simplot 47512 |42 Simplot Fry Shoestring Nat Crisp 6/4.54 $19.69 CS
Pass Through Value
6/5 Simplot Fry Wedge S S d
Simplot Savory Wedge, #47801 365184 simplot a7g01  |B/° Simplot Fry Wedge Savory Seasone 6/5¢ $20.30 CS
Pass Through Value
Simplot, Tri Tators 364525 Simplot 28022 6/5# Simplot Tri Tater 240/2 Oz 6/5# $17.41 CS
Simplot, Tater Tots - Lamb Wesson 365310 Simplot 00418 6/5# Simplot Tater Rounds Gems 6/5# $16.37CS
6/4.5# Simplot Shoestri tp
Simplot French Fries - Bake 365308 simplot 47998 |/4># Simplot Shoestring Conquest Pass | ) o, $17.83 CS
Through Value
6/4.54 Simplot Shoestring C tP
Simplot Conquest French Fries 365308 Simplot 47998 |/4># Simplot Shoestring Conquest Pass | ) o, $17.83 CS
Through Value
Simplot Quick N Crisp French Fries 375095 Gilardi 7738712405 |96/4x6 Gilardi Sausage Pizza 96ct $50.76 CS
6/4# Potato Smile Mccain Pass Through
McCain Smile Potato, OIF 03456 361066 McCain OIF03456 vé o otato smile Miccain Fass Throug 6/44 $21.42 CS
6/4# Fry C Spiral Mccain P
Mc Cain Canyon Spiral #MCLO3622 361019 McCain MCLO3622 |/4# Fry Canyon Spiral Mccain Pass 6/4 $17.34 CS
Through Value
Mc Cain Seasoned Fry 365181 Simplot 47401 6/5# Simplot Thin Savory Season Fry 6/5# $19.45CS
A ' 6/2. i Krinkl
Mc Cain Sweet Potato Krinkle Kut Fry 365488 McCain MCF04566 F{ ; ># Mccain Sweet Potato Krinkle kut | ¢ ) o, $19.69 CS
Idahoan Real Mashed Potato . .
126328 Simplot 022770 12/260z Traditions Mashed Potato 12/260z $34.13 CS

(Dehydrated),#20435




Description Fox # Brand Manf # Fox Description Pack Size Price

idah Real Scall Potat
( Dthzr:atzg),#Z;psed otato 126382 Traditions 022879  |12/20.35z Traditions Scallop Potato 12/20350z|  $35.86CS
idahoan Real AuGratin Potato (Dehydrated) 126383 Traditions 022862 12/20.35z Traditions Augratin 12/20.350z $37.87 CS
Trio Mashed Potato {(Canned) 127608 Unipro 61722 6/10# Unipro Potato Granule With Milk 6/#10 $38.00 CS
FRESH PRODUCE 50.00
Pre-cut salad lettuc f 4/54# W kF hef Salad

re-cut sala uce (Separate bags o 880509 West Creek 10292 / est Creek Fresh Chef Sala a/54 $14.40 CS
carrots & cabbage) (Separate)
Shredded lettuce 522400 Packer 10280 4/5# Lettuce Shredded 1/8" 4/54 $13.44 CS Weekly
Tomatoes 517800 Packer 10# Tomatoes 5x6 10# $11.85 CS Weekiy
Cherry Tomatoes 517900 Packer 10# Cherry Tomatoes 10# $16.35 CS Weekly
Cucumbers 500270 Packer 6CT 6ct Cucumber Super Select 6ct $5.10 CS Weekly
Onions {Spanish) 516750 Packer 50# Medium Onion 504 $18.90 CS Weekly
Carrots 515015 Packer 4/54# Fresh Carrots Baby Whole 4/5# $19.90 CS Weekly
Carrots - Baby Carrots, Individual Servings 515020 Packer 72/30z Carrots Baby Peeled 72/30z | $19.54 CS Weekly
Baby-Carrots 500220 Packer 5 5# Carrots Baby Peeled 1/5# $7.83 (S Weekly
Celery Sticks 522831 Custom 5# Celery Sticks 4" SH# $10.90 CS Weekly
Peppers, Green, Bell 500360 Packer 12CT 12ct Pepper Green 12ct $8.10 CS Weekly
Broccoli 514650 Packer 20# Broccoli Crowns Asian Cut 20# $18.95 CS Weekly
Cabbage 500180 Packer 5# 5# Cabbage Green 54 54.40 CS Weekly
Apples, Red Delicious 510100 Packer 113RAP  |113ct Apples Wash Red Delicious Fancy 113c¢t $29.85 CS Weekly
Apples, Slices 510485 Richland Hills SA200 200/20z Sliced Apples In Bag 200/20z | $56.50 CS Weekly
Bananas, Petite 510620 Packer 40# Packer Label Petite Banana Green 404 $19.65 CS Weekly
Tangerines 514425 Packer 0001 100ct Tangerines 100ct $30.90 CS Weekly
Grapes, Red Seedless, Individual Servings 511100 Packer 150/2.250z Grape Escape Red Grapes 150/20z | $53.76 CS Weekly
Grapes, Red Seedless 511000 Packer 214# Grape Lunch Bunch Red Aprox 150c¢ 21# $34.40 CS Weekly
Cantalope 511600 Packer 18CANT  |15/18ct Cantaloupe Melons 18ct $16.27 CS Weekly
Honeydews 511700 Packer 6¢ct Melons Honeydews 6ct $12.37 CS Weekly
Watermelon 511800 Packer 1ct Watermelon 18-22# Average 1ct $8.50 CS Weekly




Description Fox # Brand Manf # Fox Description Pack Size Price
Oranges, Navel 512100 Packer 1380RA  |138ct Oranges #1 California 138ct $30.90 CS Weekly
SAUCES/GRAVY $0.00
8/300z Total Ultimate Foods Regul
TUF Regular Cheese Sauce Mix, 30 0z,#088 | 141780 TUF 088 /300z Total Ultimate Foods Regular 8/3002 $49.69 CS
Cheese Sauce Mix
Cheese Sauce {Canned)} - CN Label 139262 Chef Mate 05068 6/10 Chef Mate Golden Cheese Sauce 6/#10 $69.93 CS
1 hef ion Chicken G
Chicken Gravy Mix 670903 Chef Companions 57244 iﬁ/ixsoz Chef Companion Chicken Gravy 8/1502 $22.23 CS
Brown Gravy 670905 Chef Companions 57232 8/14z Chef Companion Brown Gravy Mix 8/140z $17.59 CS
Tomato Soup, 51 oz can - Campbells 151740 Campbells 00016 12/500z Campbells Tomato Soup 12/500z $29.90 CS
Vegetarian Soup, 51 oz can - Campbells 150823 Legout 63663 12/500z Legout Vegetable Soup 12/500z $52.07 CS
Potato Soup, 51 oz. Can - Campbelis 149503 Legout 61263 12/500z Legout Cream Of Potato Soup 12/500z $52.61 CS
Soup Base {Chicken & Beef) 327888 Silversource 312021PFSZ [12/1# Silver Source Chicken Flavor Base 12/1# $26.42 CS
Mushroom Soup, 51 oz can - Campbells 151728 Campbelis 01266 12/500z Campbells Cream Of Mushroom 12/5002 $38.69 CS
Chicken Noodle, 51 oz can - Campbells 151709 Heinz 78003942 |12/49.50z Heinz Chicken Noodle Soup 12/49.50z $33.36 CS
SEASONINGS Low Sodium Varieties
. $0.00
when possible
Spaghetti Seasoning Mix 231820 Lawrys 80545 6/120z Lawrys Spaghetti Sauce Mix 6/120z $25.05 CS
Fajita Seasoning Mix 231799 Lawrys 80091 6/8.90z Lawrys Fajita Seasoning 6/8.90z $23.48 CS
6/6.6z Foothill T S ing Mi
Taco Seasoning Mix 209123 Foot Hill Farms v413-pg190 |&/8:62 Foothill Taco Seasoning Mix 6/6.602 $10.39 CS
Reduced Sodium
Chopped Onions, Dehydrated 124531 CF Sauer 38128 15# Betsy Ann Chopped Onions 154 $38.94 EA
Durkee Garlic R o Sprinkle, 19 oz,
#;‘7 i, omano -priniie, 13 0z Spec Order Durkee 379774  |190z Durkee Garlic Romano Sprinkle 190z $11.75 EA
Garlic Powder 222422 Fox 353257 170z Betsy Ann Garlic Powder 1/170z $7.26 EA
Garlic Powder 222422 Fox 353257 170z Betsy Ann Garlic Powder 1/170z $7.26 EA
Onion Powder 224080 Fox 182825 180z Betsy Ann Onion Powder 200z $5.69 EA
Onion Powder 224080 Fox 182825 180z Betsy Ann Onion Powder 200z $5.69 EA
Minced Garlic 338496 Roma 42691 4/2# Roma Garlic Chopped Water 4/24 $17.56 CS
Stuffing Mix, Chicken Flavor 136180 Betty Crocker 11600 4/3# Betty Crocker Chicken Stuffing Mix 4/3# $45.69 CS




Description Fox # Brand Manf # Fox Description Pack Size Price
SNACKS $0.00
S:”erat Mills Fruit Roll-Ups,Asst Flavors, .5 | 45,66 General Mills 11566  |4/24ct Fruit Roll Ups Hot Colors 4/24ct $21.67 CS
G ! Mills} Snak- .
Ozaxf;t;’ ;menera' ills) Snak-Ens, 1.75 128805 Gardetto 11178  |60/1.750z Gardetto Original Snaken Mix | 60/1.750z $21.78 CS
Rice Krispie Snacks, IW 216238 Kelloggs 35054 96/.78z Kelloggs Rice Krispie Treat 96/.780z $24.87 CS
TOMATO PRODUCTS - PREFER RED $0.00
GOLD .
100 Packer Label Red Gold Ketch
Ketchup Portion Pack, 7 gm 132789 Red Gold REDY59G Pacf é tggm acker Label Red GOl RELNUP| 4 500/9gm $15.15 CS
6/10 Red Gold Packer Label 33% F
Ketchup, 33% Fancy 132506 Red Gold REDYsg9 |/ 10 Red Gold Packer Label 33% Fancy 6/410 $18.96 CS
Ketchup
3gal Red Gold Vol Pack Ketch
Ketchup, 700455 Red gold sBoggy |53 hed bold VolFack Retchup 3gal $15.00 EA
Dispenser
Prepared Pasta Sauce 138674 Primo 40139 6/10 Primo Qualita Spag Sauce 6/#10 $18.40 CS
Tomato Sauce, #10 131113 Red Gold REDHAS9 [6/10 Red Gold Fancy Tomato Sauce 6/#10 $18.92 CS
Diced Tomato, #10 878218 West Creek WETBQ99 |6/10# West Creek Diced Tomato In Juice 6/#10 $19.02 CS
VEGETABLES Low Sodium Varieties
. $0.00
when possible
Cut Corn, USDA grade A standard, bulk 354521 Simplot 18709 20# Simplot Cut Corn Simply Sweet 1/20# $16.49 CS
Cut Corn, USDA grade A standard 355720 Simplot 18733 12/2.5# Simplot Cut Corn 12/2.5# $25.01 CS
Corn on the Cob, 2 or 3" 355941 Simplot 18732 96c¢t Simplot Corn Cobbettes 3 inch 96c¢t $21.20CS
6/10C Packer Label F
Corn (Canned]) 122548 Comsource 33828 /10 Comsource Packer Label Fancy 6/#10 $20.37 CS
Whole Kernel Corn
Vegetable Mix, (at least 4 vegetables)Grade . .
A Fgancy ( getables) 356950 Simplot 18810  |20# Simplot 5way Mixed Vegetables 1/20# $18.37 CS
10 P | Mi
Vegetable Mix (Canned) 123544 Comsource gop13  |B/10 Comsource Packer Label Mixed 6/410 $24.71 CS
Vegetables
California Blend, 12/2# 357707 Simplot 18833 12/2# Simplot California Blend Vegetable 12/2# $24.58 CS
Green Beans, Grad A Fancy, 12/2# 359009 Simplot 18039 12/2# Simplot Cut Green Beans 12/2# $20.75 CS
Green Beans, Grade A Fancy, bulk 359005 Simplot 18180 20# Simplot Whole Green Beans 204 $22.29CS
Green Beans (Canned) 117289 Packer 2400006581 |6/10 Packer Label Mix Cut Green Bean 6/#10 $15.72 CS




Description Fox # Brand Manf # Fox Description Pack Size Price
Peas & Carrots, 12/2# 357162 Simplot 18855 12/2.5# Simplot Peas And Carrots 12/2.54 $26.03 CS
Peas & Carrots, bulk 359008 Simplot 95366 20# Simplot Peas And Carrots 204 $17.24 CS
6 C Packer L IF P
Peas & Carrots (Canned) 125180 Comsource 150cag  |/10 Comsource Packer Label Fancy Peas | o ) $30.32 CS
& Carrots
6/10 C Packer Label S t P
Peas (Canned) 124743 Comsource L17897 |/10 Comsource Packer Label Sweet Peas| ., $25.12 CS
Mix Sieve
6/10 Comso Packer Label Medium
Carrots sliced-{Canned) 122106 Comsource 93214 / omsource Facker Label Miediu 6/#10 $19.97 CS
Sliced Carrot
208 W kB li Cuts Individuall
Broccoli Cuts, 20 993279 West Creek 86936222 |20 West Creek Broccoli Cuts Individually | -y 5y $15.83 CS
Quick Frozen
Sliced Jalepeno Peppers, Gal. Jars 124559 Formella & Sons 00725 4/1gal Formella Jalapeno Pepper Sliced 4/1gal $23.62 CS
Olives (Sliced) Black 237649 Bell-Carter 342000 |6/10 Lindsay Sliced Black Olives 6/#10 $45.26 CS
DAIRY Low Fat when possible $0.00
402D b Peach Mini
Yogurt, Asst Flavors, 4 oz 161169 Dannon 00423 i:t/ Fi’:e annon Strawberry Peach Min! 24/407 $10.22 CS
Philadelphia Cream Cheese, Plain, 1 .
. é i 9p ’ eese, Flain, L oz 160526 Kraft 61119  |100/10z Philadelphia Cream Cheese Cup | 100/loz | $19.43 CS Weekly
Philadelphia Cream Cheese, Strawberry, 1 100/10z Philadelphia Strawb
iladelphi am Strawberry, 1 0z 160830 Kraft 72683 0/10z Philadelphia Strawberry Cream 100/10z | $20.23 CS Weekly
JH72683 Cheese Cup
Philadelphia Cream Cheese, Garden Veg, 1 100/10z Philadelphia Garden Vegetable
1 34 K 72687 10 20.23 CS Weekl
0z, H72687 608 raft Cream Cheese Cup 0/10z |5 eexty
Margarine Portion Packs, 5 gms {Churn
Cupsg) gms (Chu 157455 West Creek 89067WCK |900/5gm West Creek Margarine Spread | 900/5gm $18.14 CS
Margarine Portion Packs, 5 Churn 60 P ise M i 09
8 gms (Chu 165355 Promise 1111518200 |000/>8M Promise Margarine Cups 0% 600/5gm | $24.72 CS Weekly
Cups) Trans Fat
N 2/17.58# W k Liqui i 9
Margarine, Liquid (buttery flavor), 17.54 157454 West Creek 89215 T{ . est Creek Liquid Margarine 0% | 1. ¢ | 428 94 Cs Weekly
- 2/17.5# West C iquid Margarine 0%
Margarine, Liquid (buttery flavor), 17.5# 157454 West Creek 89215 Tﬁ az‘ssfat est Creek Liquid Margarine 0% | 15 o | ¢28.94 Cs Weekly
Margarine, Solid, 30# 157451 West Creek 10028 30/1# West Creek Margarine Solid 30# $17.33 CS Weekly
Parmesan Cheese, Grated, 161004 Unipro 90842 ;ig t’:rcap“m Parmesan Cheese Grated 12/14 | $44.27 CS Weekly
200/3. P
Parmesan Cheese, Grated, (packets) 232186 Roma 58824 0/3.5gm Roma Grated Parmesan 200/3.5 gm | $15.27 CS Weekly

Cheese




Description Fox # Brand Manf # Fox Description Pack Size Price
4/5# West Creek Swiss A i 160
White American, 160slice (Real) Swiss - 158724 West Creek 31918 Séce est Lreek swiss American 4/5# | $49.45 CS Weekly
White American, 160slice (Imitation) 160972 Unipro 18592 4/5# 160s| Substitute Swiss 4/54# $31.57 CS Weekly
2/5# L kes 1 liced Yell
Yellow American, 160slice (Real) 157103 Lando Lakes ae3zs | /5% Lando Lakes 160 Sliced Yellow 2/54 | $29.22 CS Weekly
American Cheese
4/54 W i Yell
Yellow American, 160slice (Imitation) 158720 West Creek 31914 1{350 S“CZS"; Creek American Cheese Yellow| ., $49.97 CS
100/10z Schreiber A i Snack Pack
Schreiber American Snack Pack, 1 oz, #32445| 158556 Schreiber 33044 L;ﬂ{[ S LA LSS LSS 100/10z | $24.89 CS Weekly
4/5# West Creek Swiss A i 160
SwissCheese, Processed, 160 slice 158724 West Creek 31918 sﬁ ‘z‘ : est Lreek swiss American a/SH | $49.45 CS Weekly
String Ch , Indiv Wrap, 1 L -0- . i i
ring Cheese, Indiv Wrap, 1 oz Land-O 158405 Schreiber 55207 168./.12 Schreiber String Cheese 168/10z | $41.04 CS Weekly
Lakes individually Wrapped
Sour Cream, Indiv Tetra Packs, 300 393806 Prairie Farms 16389 100/10z Hood Fresh Sour Cream Cups 100/10z | $13.52 CS Weekly
Sour Cream, indiv Cups 1oz. 393806 Prairie Farms 16389 100/10z Hood Fresh Sour Cream Cups 100/10z | $13.52 CS Weekly
tand O'Lakes Mac & Cheese, #43280 Red 6/5# Lando Lakes Macaroni & Cheese
988753 k 43294 SH# 60.60 CS
Fat/Low Sodium Whole Grain Land O Lakes 3 Reduced Sodium Reduced Fat Pass T 2 ?
Fresh Eggs {in shell) 271456 West Creek 271456 15dz West Creek Medium Grade A Eggs 15dz $14.60 CS Weekly
Frozen Eggs (liquid) - Michaels 399535 MICHAEL FOODS 54132 6/5# Michaels Scrambled Egg Mix Carton 6/5# $41.40 CS
2 ini tt
Small Curd Cottage Cheese 165478 Prairie Farms 5294 C{JSr:: Prairie Farm Cottage Cheese Sm 2/5# $18.46 CS Weekly
PORTION PACKS $0.00
Taco Sauce, 9 gm 209234 PPI 78000850 |500/9gm Ppi American Taco Sauce 500/9gm $9.72 CS
Mustard, gal 228818 Woeber 00111 4/1gal Woeber Prepared Mustard 4/1gal $10.00 CS
Mustard, Portion Pack, 4.5 gm 228587 Heinz 78000702 |1000-1/50z Heinz Mustard Packet 1000-1/50z $19.48 CS
Honey Mustard, 1 oz. Individual 240548 Kens KE634A5 |100/1.50z Ken Honey Mustard Cup 100/1.50z $19.07 CS
. 4/1 i
Hamburger Dill Slices, 1/8 cut 235407 Fox 1a005  |*/1gel Lake Valley Hamburger Pickle 1/8 | | $18.49 CS
Smooth
Pickle, Dill, Indiv Wrap, 7 oz 238090 Gielow BO-600 gﬁftpizk’w Individually Wrapped Whole | 0, $16.09 CS
ilt Pickie
Pickle Spears, Dill, 1 oz 238060 Gielow LL-290 5gal/300ct Gielow Pickle Spear 5gal/300ct $18.87 CS
Dill Pickle Relish 235636 Fox 14045 4/1gal Lake Valley Sweet Relish 4/1gal $24.84 CS
Dill Pickie Relish (packets) 235849 PPI 78000417 |200/9gm Ppi Sweet Relish 200/9gm $8.58 CS




Description Fox # Brand Manf # Fox Description Pack Size Price
Sweet Relish 235636 Fox 14045 4/1gal Lake Valley Sweet Relish 4/1gal $24.84 CS
Sweet Relish (packets) 235849 PPi 78000417 |200/9gm Ppi Sweet Relish 200/9gm $8.58 CS
201 Ppi A i B S
B.B.Q. Sauce, 12 gm 252441 PPI/Americana 78000848 Pog{: izgm pi American Barbeque Sauce | 5150, $5.09 CS
B.B.Q. Sauce, gal 132375 Marzetti 83030 4/1gal Marzetti Original Barbeque Sauce 4/1gal $24.49 CS
Tartar Sauce, 12 gm 242229 PPI 78000423 ]200/12gm Ppi Tartar Sauce 200/12gm 58.88 CS
Sweet & Sour Sauce, .5 oz 138711 Packer 16014 500/.50z Sweet And Sour Sauce Pack 500/.50z $12.03 CS
Sweet & Sour Sauce, 1 0z cups Spec Order Taste Pleasers 78000415 ]100/1z Ppi Sweet & Sour Sauce Cup 100/10z $16.27 CS
Marinara Sauce Cup, 1 0z 130890 Red Gold REDNA2796 |96/20z Red Gold Marinara Sauce 96/202 $23.68 CS
100/1.50z Ppi A i P ke §
Pancake Syrup, 1.5 0z Cup 248152 PPI 78000842 POU{: " oz FprAmerican Fancake syrub 1 140/1.502 $7.00 CS
Bacon Bits, imitation, 10# 139892 Packer 4410561766 |20# Unipro Imitation Bacon Bits 208 $29.75CS
Peanut Butter, .75 oz. Cups 249385 Smuckers 2282 200/.75 Smuckers Peanut Butter 200/.750z $42.90 CS
200/1 Ppi A i #10 A d
1 oz. Individual packets, assorted flavors 251225 PPI 78000854 ngy/ Ogm Ppi American #10 Assorte 200/10gm $5.62 CS
Salsa - (prefer Red Gold) 130667 Red Gold REDSC99 16/10# Red Gold Salsa 6/#10 $25.21 CS
250/.2 Fresh G d
Croutons, Indiv Wrap, .25 oz 173275 Sugar Foods Corp 74470 Cm: toioz resh Gourmet seasone 250/.250z |  $19.84CS
FOOD PACKAGING $0.00
Handguards, 7X6.5 Sandwich Bags 374162 304985445 |2m Bww Sb8.5 Sandwich Bag 6.5x7 $8.87 CS
27X37 Food Grade Bun Pan Bag 317137 Foodhandler 303679979 [200 27x37 Packer Label Bun Pan Bags 200ct $15.12CS
Brown Paper Lunch Bag 312208 AlM 80983 500/6# Packer Label Brown Paper Bags 500/6# $8.32 CS
Bun Rack Cover, Hi-Density, 52X80 - Food
oo Y © 317145 Packer BUNO5280 |50ct Packer Label 52"X83" Bun Pan Rack |  50ct $34.10 CS
. . 8m Tork Lowf i in Whi
Dispenser Roll Napkin, 9"X17" - Sea 490020 Tork D3061B 7;"1 2°r owfold Dispenser Napkin White| ¢, $35.60 CS
Tidy Napkins - Dispenser 32/250 ct. 290004 Morcon D1217 6m Morcon Dispenser Napkin 1 Ply 12x17]  6000ct $40.26 CS
Tri-Fold Napkin 290343 SCA/Tork DX900 6m Tork Xpressnap White 8.5x13 Napkin 6000ct $48.87 CS
FOOD CONTAINERS $0.00
4 oz plastic translucent portion cup (spec lid
L P P (sp 275254 Dart 400PCL 20/125¢ct Dart Lid Souffle 3.25-5.50z 20/125 Ct $24.43 CS

below)




Description Fox # Brand Manf # Fox Description Pack Size Price
Plastic solid lid for 4 oz plastic cup above 275254 Dart 400PCL 20/125c¢t Dart Lid Souffle 3.25-5.50z 20/125 Ct $24.43 CS
2 oz plastic translucent portion cup (spec lid .
below) 275531 Dart 250pPC 20/125ct Plastic Souffle Cup 2.50z 20/125 Ct $31.64 CS
Plastic solid lid for 2 oz plastic cup above 275755 Dart 200PCL  ]20/125ct Lids Souffle 1.50 - 2.50z 20/125 Ct $22.24 CS
5 lastic translucent portion ¢ lid
b;:)\z) ' ucent portion cup (speclid |,/ ¢qq Dart 5N25  |2.5m/50z Dart Plastic Translucent Cup | 2500/50z $33.65 CS
25/100 Special Order Dart Lid 5-7
Plastic solid lid for 5 oz plastic cup above 275084 Dart L7N25 /100 Special Order Dart Lid 5-72 25/100ct $62.22 CS
Translucent Cup
Paper Plate, 9" - Lightweight 250905 Silversource 042658  |12/100ct Silver Source 9" Paper Plate 12/100 ct §21.55CS
Paper Plate, 6" 291838 Aspen 10106-7  |1m/6" White Paper Plate 1/1000 ct $12.40CS
Soup Bowl, 10 oz. 660146 Dart 10B20 1m/100z Dart White Foam Bowl 10b20 1000/100z $30.84 CS
Soup Bowl, 12 oz. (Foam) 287308 Genpak 82100 1m Genpak 120z White Foam Bowl 1000/120z $17.86 CS
Six {6) Compart t Styrof Tray - 500 k t t White F
bx (6) Compartment Styrofoam Tray 287355 Genpak 10600WHITE |00 Genpak 6 Compartment White Foam | ) $27.10 CS
GenPak Tray 12.5x8
1 Packer Label Small Poly Gi
Glove, Good Quality Poly, (small, med, Ig) 374154 Trone 210010 |10/100ct Packer Label Small Poly Glove | o ¢ $16.24 CS
Embossed
4/100ct First Mark i |
Glove, Good Quality Latex, {(small, med, Ig) 240786 First Mark 304763102 Li/ght ct First Mark Medium Latex Gloves 4/100 ct $24.12 CS
Handi-Wipes, Reusable Wiping Clothes - 150ct Pack 1 13.5x21 White Wi
P € Yiping tiothes 282862 Packer FsT3000w | Lo0Ct Packer Label 13.5x21 White Wiper |, ., $25.59 CS
Alton White Towel
FOOD WRAPS $0.00
24x2m Film Poly Vinyl Chloride W
24"x2000' * Plastic Film Spec Order Companions 30550074 |>*@M Film Poly Vinyl Chioride Wrap 1/2000' $24.48 CS
Companions
1m/1# Sil S Food Tray Red
Food Tray Paper 1000/1# 352618 Silver Source 8701 #To/ 0 flver Source Paper Food Tray Red |, 3¢ $18.22 CS
Food Tray Paper 1000/4 oz. 300950 Silver Source 88010 1m/4o0z Paper Food Tray #25 1000ct $12.61CS
1m/8z Silver S Tray R
Food Tray Paper 100 / 8 oz 352620 Silver Source 8708 #g:)/ 2 Silver Source Paper Food Tray Red | o ¢ $16.26 CS
18"x2000" Heavy Duty Foil 302518 Packer 11807 18x1m Heavy Weight Foil 18x1000' $40.01 CS
Foil Sheets, 10.75" X 12" 302447 Packer GP62 5/500ct 10.5x13 Red Foil Sheets 5/500ct $68.11 CS
Waxed Deli Sheets, Dispenser Pack 15"X15" 317721 Packer MDDW15  |2m 15x15 Flat Dry Wax Paper 2000ct $29.28 CS




Description Fox # Brand Manf # Fox Description Pack Size Price
Pan Liner, Quillon, 254, 16"X24" 318030 Handy Wacks PL-25-1 1m Pan Liner 16x24 Quilon 25# 1000ct $30.58 CS
Foil/Paper "honeycomb" sandwich wrap, 302445 Packer GGW68  |5/500 10.5x14 Silver Foil Wrap 5/500ct $60.15 CS
10.5"X13" list colors
CUTLERY / KITCHEN SUPPLIES $0.00
1m Medi Weight Whi
Spoon, Med W. Plastic - Poly Prop 399980 Packer vi7s002 |1 Medium Weight White Spoon 1000ct $8.34 CS
Polypropelene Layer
Spoon, Med Wt. Stainless Steel 318838 Dominion DOM-111-3 |36ct Dominion Teaspoon Stainless Steel 36¢t $3.17 EA
1m Medium Weight S S
Soup Spoon, Med W. Plastic - Poly Prop 399986 Packer V175004 |- eaium Weight soup spoon 1000ct $8.23 CS
Polypropelene Layer
2dz Dominion S S Staini
Soup Spoon, Med Wt. Stainless Steel 318836 Dominion 7a12 | ;‘ OmInion Soup Spoons Stainiess 2dz $2.92 EA
Knives, Med Wt. Plastic* - Poly Styr 300600 Dart K6BW 1m Dart Medium Weight White Knives 1000ct $15.95CS
1d» Dormimion Di - -
Knives, Med Wt. Stainless Steel - Delco 318839 Dominion DOM-331-1 Stezel ominion Dinner Knives Stainless 1dz $3.66 EA
1m Medium Weight Whit k 5.5"
Sporks, Med Wt. Plastic 399403 Packer vi7s020 |1 Medium Weight White Spork 5.5 1000ct $8.90 CS
Polypropelene Layer
Modi - -
Fork, Med. Wt. Plastic 399975 Packer vizspon |- Medium Weight White Fork 1000ct $8.45 CS
Polypropelene Layer
Fork, Med Wt. Stainless Steel 800102 Dominion DOM-221-3 {36ct Dominion Forks Stainless Steel 36¢ct $4.46 EA
Spatula, Med Wt. 700940 Tablecraft PSD-10 1 Ea 10" High Temp Scraper Spatula 9.5in S$2.76 EA
Sheet Pans, Med Wt. 16 x:24 318030 Handy Wacks PL-25-1 1m Pan Liner 16x24 Quilon 25# 1000ct $30.58 CS
Spoodles, Med Wt. 709002 Winco FPS4 lea 4oz Solid Spoodle Stainless Steel lea S4.00 EA
Plastic Serving Trays 10x14 brown 700539 Packer NPL6100003 |2 Doz 10x14 Plastic Trays Brown 24ct $25.10CS
Plastic Serving Trays 14x18 brown 700534 Packer 1 Doz 14x18 Plastic Trays Brown 12ct $24.97 CS
Quart Size Clear Plastic 986062 Foodhandler 304985120 }500/1qt Packer Label 7x8 Ziploc Bags 500/1qt $13.25CS
Gallon Size Clear Plastic 317104 Foodhandler 20-FS1014 |1m Foodhandler 10x14 Storage Bags Roll 1000ct $13.92 CS
Quart Size Clear Plastic - Zip seal 986062 Foodhandler 304985120 |500/1qt Packer Label 7x8 Ziploc Bags 500/1qt $13.25CS
) N 250/1gal Pack .5"X10.5" Zipl
Gallon Size Clear Plastic - Zip seal 986064 Foodhandler 304985130 Bzg/ gal Packer Label 10.5"X10.5" Ziploc 250/1gal $27.95CS
Food Rotation Shelf Life Labels 300025 Daymark 112437 250ct Daymark 2x2 Shelf Life Label 250ct $10.28 EA
Refrigerator Freezer Therm Labels 2x3 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.00
Kit 1" SP Label w/ Dispenser Spec Order victor N211 KIT 1" SP LABELS W/ DISPENSER Kit $25.10 EA




Description Fox # Brand Manf # Fox Description Pack Size Price
CLEANERS $0.00
Bleach, All Purpose, gal 247723 First Mark 37896 6/1gal First Mark Sani Bleach 6/1 gal $9.59 CS
Dish Detergent, Dawn, gal 322324 Dawn 57445 4/1gal Dawn Original Liquid Detergent 4/1 gal $54.69 CS
Pink Liquid Detergent 321974 US Chemical 057007  |4/1gal Us Chemical Pink Liquid Detergent 4/1gal $66.69 CS
Lime Attack 329004 Fox 0430041 |4/1gal Chempro Delimer 4/1gal $32.58 CS
Chlorine Dishwater soap (2# bags) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.00
12ct Silver Source Stainless Steel
ing Spo 318936 Silver S 84SS 12/1 ct 6.93 CS
Scouring Sponges ilver Source Scrubber 1.7502 /1c S
Rinse Rite Spot free rinse 329002 Packer 0380015 |5gal Chempro All Temp Rinse Aid 1/5gal $29.22 CS
Spic'N'Span Liquid Floor Cleaner, gal 30864 spic & span 02001 3/1gal Spic N Span Span Floor Cleaner 3/1gal $55.98 CS
Cleaner Pad/ Alcohol Sanitizer Spec Order Packer 442878 10/100 Thermometer Cleaning Wipes 10/100ct $21.01CS
Test Strip , Sanitizer, Chlorine, Conti . .
Rijt rip ., sanitizer, Chiorine, Continuous | - 550,56 Packer Label CM2/DIS302 |1 Ea Roll Chiorine Test Strips 1 roll $6.60 EA
ADDITIONAL ITEMS $0.00
Advance 378542 Clovervale 80140 96/40z Clovervale Diced Peaches 96/40z $68.06 CS
Advance 378534 PIERRE FOODS 1290  |}60/2.22 Pierre Peanut Butter & Jelly 160/2.20z | $71.28 CS
Graham Wafers Whole Grain
200/, - - - -
Advance 221473 Advance 68031 | 100/-62 Advancepierre Chicken Ring Spicy| 0/ o', $44.38 CS
Whole Grain
Advance 221744 Advance 68079  |100/2:35Special Order Advancepierre |10, 5 5o )| <4563 cs

Egg Cheese Sandwich Whole Grain




